
   
   

 

American Express® Terms and Conditions 

• American Express Platinum Cardmembers can enjoy all the Card related benefits as long as their 
Accounts are in good standing. 

• The benefits under this program are being made by American Express/Partners of American 
Express on a “best effort basis” and are subject to availability and Cardmembers must exercise 
due diligence in understanding specific terms that may be applicable to such benefits. 

• American Express is neither responsible nor guarantees the quality of the goods/services and 
nor is it liable for any defect or deficiency of goods or services so obtained/availed by 
Cardmember at the establishment. 

• American Express and the partners reserve the right to change/withdraw the Terms and 
Conditions of any offer at any time without prior notice. 

• The benefits can be used only in conjunction with the American Express Platinum Card and 
cannot be combined with any other promotion or offer. 

• Benefits associated with American Express Cards are subject to payment of annual/renewal fee 
and maybe withdrawn. 

• Any participation/availment of the benefits by American Express Platinum Card member shall be 
purely voluntary. 

• The Card member understands and agrees that American Express will be sharing information 
(Name/Date of Birth/Address/Email id/Mobile Number/Gender/Title) with Accor hotels and it is 
the same information shared during the American Express application process. 

• These Terms and Conditions are to be read in conjunction with the Cardmember Terms and 
Conditions governing the usage of the American Express Platinum Card and may be deemed as 
the Terms and Conditions governing the American Express Platinum Cardmembership. American 
Express Platinum Card is only the mode of payment for the below services. American Express 
does not take responsibility for the quality of service provided by the partner and are not liable 
for any direct, indirect, incidental, special, punitive, exemplary, or consequential damages of any 
kind. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



   
   

 

 

Accor Plus Traveller Membership Program 

• This offer is valid from 8th October 2024 to 30th September 2025 (both days included). 

• The 12 months complimentary membership includes the below benefits: 

o Up to 50% off on dining at over 1,400 participating Accor hotel restaurants across Asia 

Pacific. 

o 15% off on drinks at participating Accor hotels in Asia. 

o Up to 50% savings with exclusive stay offers at more than 1,000 participating Accor 

hotels in Asia Pacific. 

o Members' Rate at minimum 10% off the best available public room rate. 

o Early access to Accor hotel sales. 

o Automatically qualify for Elite membership status in ALL - Accor Live Limitless, Accor's 

global lifestyle loyalty program and enjoy a bonus of 20 Status Nights. 

o Enjoy exclusive access to member-only events such as celebrity masterclasses, unique 

wine and dine experiences and more. 

o Exclusive member vouchers including complimentary room upgrade, birthday cake and 

dessert, 40% off group dining and INR 500 discount on dining. 

• This membership is only available to the American Express Platinum Basic Cardmember on 
enrollment.  

• Cardmembers will be required to fill the Accor Plus Traveller membership Enrollment Form 
available on the American Express website to get enrolled in the Accor Plus Traveller 
membership Program.  

• Enrolment into Accor Plus Traveller membership including the dispatch of the Accor Plus 
Traveller membership digital welcome kit may take up to 60 days from the date of enrolment.  

• The offers cannot be clubbed in conjunction with any other offer that may be available to the 
Cardmember under any other scheme, or any other program offered by Accor group.  

• The features/benefits of the Accor Plus Traveller Membership availed as part of American 
Express offer may differ from the features/benefits of the Accor Plus Traveller Membership as 
availed directly through Accor, or via other channels.  

• Cardmembers shall continue to enjoy the privileges of Accor Plus Traveller Membership as long 
as they continue to hold the American Express Platinum Card.  

• The terms and conditions of Accor Plus Traveller (available at 
https://www.accorplus.com/in/about/terms-and-conditions/) will apply.  

• For any queries cardmembers can email at amexcare@accorplus.com. Alternatively, they can 
also connect with the team on WhatsApp chat @ +91 92050 07271 from 9:30 am till 6:30 pm IST 
(Monday - Friday excluding Public Holidays)  
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